
1. Does the Force’s Police and Crime Panel include representatives of local health bodies 
(in particular Clinical Commissioning Groups (CCGs) or Health and Wellbeing Boards 
(HAWB))?  Where your force area contains multiple HAWBs/CCGs how many of these 
are represented on the panel ? 
 

2. Does the Force’s Police and Crime Panel include members selected for their expertise in 
(a) drug/substance abuse, (b) alcohol abuse or (c) both? 

 
The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner (OPCC) does not hold the information 
that you require.   The Police and Crime Panel in West Yorkshire has been establi shed 
and is supported by Wakefield Metropoli tan District Council, acting as lead local authority 
for the West Yorkshire area for this purpose.    (The Police and Crime Panel is not a part 
of West Yorkshire Police or the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner).  You can 
contact the Poli ce and Crime Panel for further information about membership at this 
address:  Rooms 206 and 207, County Hall , Burton Street, Wakefield, WF1 2QW (www. 
westyorkshire-pcp.gov.uk). 

 
3. How much did the Force spend on drug intervention projects (or equivalent schemes) in 

2012/13 and 2013/14?  
 

4. How much funding has been allocated for drug intervention projects (or equivalent 
schemes) in 2014/15? 

 
The OPCC does not hold the full financial information that you have requested.   You may 
find that West Yorkshire Police can provide this information and you can contact  the 
Force FOI team at:  West Yorkshire Police, PO Box 9, Labur num road, Wakefield, WF1 
3QP (email:  foi@westyorkshire.pnn.police.uk).    
 
I am attaching a response which we have publi shed to a previous FOI request, however, 
and a copy of the Commi ssioner’s early intentions towar ds commissioning which you 
might find helpful.    This identifies the contributions which the Commissioner has made 
from his Community Safety Fund t owards services relating to drug or alcohol use which 
have been provided both by West Yorkshire Police and by our partners. 
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